




























From: Kimber Ivy
To: City Treasurer
Subject: Re: 2024 0305 AP Review
Date: Tuesday, March 5, 2024 1:44:51 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Approved

Let's talk more another time on the court stuff. 

Thanks,
Mayor Ivy

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: City Treasurer <roycityhall@cityofroywa.us>
Sent: Tuesday, March 5, 2024 12:02:36 PM
To: Kimber Ivy <Mayor@cityofroywa.us>
Subject: 2024 0305 AP Review
 
Hello Ma’am!
 
Please take time to review the 2024 0305 AP Run. If you have any questions, please don’t hesitate to reach out.
 
Thanks,
 
 

 
Michael Malek
City Clerk - Treasurer
City of Roy
PO Box 700
Roy, WA  98580
(253) 843-1113
https://www.cityofroywa.us
 

mailto:Mayor@cityofroywa.us
mailto:roycityhall@cityofroywa.us
https://m365.us.vadesecure.com/safeproxy/v4?f=pY04wdWW9gzoh_TOJ38jsfzeANPoGX3UW7G6yL4sZiHnXIrVA33Mj0C6X4uGLVZ0&i=pp8nWOp4snCiaD--zIZkRTaUWm2bZive-eZ7J6MUfqHP_hmihsf3ut-VW0ouXYxQXAjKgoeqQ8r5zPpmvMqgBQ&k=6Zjy&r=PWVHYsodewTUTCf4UR8dBafMt8ETAG-7xFKPSFW3zxMaxUmPk4BJoa9h6k7de3tY&s=662c6dbda084da9579bab74412a6c4f1723816b2b78ffebf02e59ed3ed91670c&u=https%3A%2F%2Faka.ms%2FAAb9ysg

Accounts Payable Batches

AddNew  View Approve  Memorize User:
» Status Due Amount Hemo Dept Paid_Year
000

1314 Approved  Claims  02127/2024 21.00 Car Wash Enterprises INV #Jan24-25 - Clean Fleet o000 O
11320 Approved  Claims 0212812024  7,070.87 Cimco-GC Systems, LLC INV #5011 - Rebuild Of Booster Pump Control Valve For Well o0 O
11319 Approved  Claims 0212812024 11649 103  Comcast 02/24/2024-03123/2024 - Received 2/27/2024 - Internet o000 O
11316 Approved  Claims 0212812024 407.90 3107 Comcast INV #193914938 - Bill Date 2/1/2024 - Received 2/26/24 o0 O
1337 Approved  Claims 03052024 63274 1599 FloHawks Plumbing + Septic INV#56231699 & INV #66231698 - Pumping Of Park And City Hall o0 O
11336 Approved  Claims  03/0412024 3049 3809 LEAF INV #16137833 - Contract 100-8398261-001 - 2024 02 Ink. o0 O
1332 Approved  Claims  02/29/2024 39251 2821 Orca Pacific, Inc INV #0608070 HASA Multichior Sodium Hypochlorite & Delivery 000 [
11338 Approved  Claims 0310412024 5641 1787  Pierce County Budget & Finance Dept 2024 02- City Of Roy Cout Remitance - Crime Victims Contributions w0 O
1315 Approved  Claims 02282024 51600 1430 PugetSound Clean ArAgency INV#23-074 - Clean A Assessment For 2023 o0 O
1317 Approved  Claims  02/2812024 329019 368  Puget Sound Energy, Inc. 2024 03 - 3776 - Received 02/26/2024 o0 O
1333 Approved  Claims  03/04/2024 201.00 3830 R1WebDesign INV #1669 - R1 WebDesign Senices (Website Hosting, Plugins For Word Press/FB Posting) 000 [
11318 Approved  Claims 0212812024 53321 1778 Verizon Wireless INV #9957003175 (9237-00001) 01/19/24-02118/24 Cell Senvice o0 O
11335 Approved  Claims ~ 03/04/12024 544908 520 Washington State Treasurer 2024 0248 OST DOC #85002000 o000 O





Kimber Ivy 
City of Roy 23-20095.00
216 McNaught Rd S 

February 22, 2024 
Project No: 
Invoice No: 0019893

Roy, WA 98580 

Planning Services for the 2024 Comprehensive Plan Periodic Update 
Professional Services from October 21, 2023 to January 26, 2024 

Task 004 Environmental Review, Adoption, and Implementation 
Fee 

Total Fee 2,500.00 

Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 2,500.00 
Previous Fee Billing 0.00 
Current Fee Billing 2,500.00 

Total Fee 2,500.00 

Total this Task $2,500.00 

Task 005 Identify Development Regulations for Revisions and Updates 
Fee 

Total Fee 2,500.00 

Percent Complete 50.00 Total Earned 1,250.00 
Previous Fee Billing 0.00 
Current Fee Billing 1,250.00 

Total Fee 1,250.00 

Total this Task $1,250.00 

Task 006 Adoption Assistance
Fee 

Total Fee 2,500.00 

Percent Complete 50.00 Total Earned 1,250.00 
Previous Fee Billing 0.00 
Current Fee Billing 1,250.00 

Total Fee 1,250.00 

Total this Task $1,250.00 

Task 007 Jackson Civil
Fee 

Total Fee 27,500.00 

Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 27,500.00 
Previous Fee Billing 23,650.00 
Current Fee Billing 3,850.00 

Total Fee 3,850.00 

Total this Task $3,850.00 

Total this Invoice  $8,850.00 



Car Wash Enterprises, Inc.
3977 Leary Way NW
Seattle, WA 98107
2062742610

INVOICE

Invoice #: Jan24-25

Invoice Date: 02/22/24

Amount Due: $21.00

Bill To:

City of Roy
P.O. Box 700
Roy, WA 98580
United States

 

Due Date Terms Account Number

03/23/24 Net 30 25

 
 
 

Description Quantity Price Amount

Clean Fleet 3 $6.34921 $19.05
 

 Subtotal: $19.05
Sales Tax (10.25%): $1.95

Total: $21.00
Payments: $0.00

Amount Due: $21.00

 
Pay by Check (No Fee)

Pay by Phone (3.5% Fee)

Pay Online:

- Credit Card (2.9% Fee)

- ePayment (No Fee)

 

Thank you for being a valued Brown Bear customer!
 
To pay online, go to https://app02.us.bill.com/p/00802HLAEXCSVGU1k3qw

https://app02.us.bill.com/p/00802HLAEXCSVGU1k3qw


City of Roy (AccountID :25)
PO Box 700
Roy  WA 98580

Trans ID Device Date First Name Last Name ID# License RFID/
Barco

de

Additional Info Service Item 
Price

Subtotal Tax Total Amount 
Tendered

Charged

Site : 1015

7114064 Auto Sentry 2 
1002

1/3/2024 2:34 
PM

2 ROY PD 63331D #9525
83098

Fleet Clean ($5 
Disc)

$6.36 $6.36 $0.64 $7.00 $7.00 $7.00

7130341 Auto Sentry 2 
1002

1/11/2024 
2:33 PM

2 ROY PD 63331D #9525
83098

Fleet Clean ($5 
Disc)

$6.36 $6.36 $0.64 $7.00 $7.00 $7.00

7136436 Auto Sentry 2 
1002

1/25/2024 
9:56 AM

1 ROY PD 70926D #9525
83097

Fleet Clean ($5 
Disc)

$6.36 $6.36 $0.64 $7.00 $7.00 $7.00

1015 Total for 3 Transactions $19.08 $1.92 $21.00 $21.00 $21.00

Total for 3 Transactions $19.08 $1.92 $21.00 $21.00 $21.00

Page: 49 of 225

FLEET ACTIVITY

Requested By: CC\ICSADMIN
On Thursday, February 1, 2024
6:00:06 AM

Corporate 3977 Leary Way NW, Seattle, WA 98107 (206) 789-3700

V 2.6.13.2

From: 1/1/2024 To: 1/31/2024

























$632.74
Total Invoices  

$0.00
Total Payments  

$632.74
Balance

$6.26
<= 30  

$0.00
30 - 60  

$0.00
60 - 90  

$0.00
90 - 120  

$626.48
> 120

Statement

Bill to:
City of Roy #321-80
565 McNaught Road South
Roy, WA 98580 USA

PAST DUE - PLEASE REMIT

Invoice # Type
Customer
PO

Project Invoice
#

Invoiced
On Technicians Location

Due
Date Total Payments Balance Subtotal

66231699 201054882 9/27/23 TRACEY
GIACOMELLI

216 McNaught Road
South

9/27/23 $232.09 $0.00 $232.09 $232.09

66231698 201053128 9/27/23 TRACEY
GIACOMELLI

122 3rd Street 9/27/23 $394.39 $0.00 $394.39 $626.48

FINCHARGE 1/31/24 3/1/24 $6.26 $0.00 $6.26 $632.74

Please remit to:
PO BOX 735457
DALLAS, TX 75373
P: 253-848-7186
F: 253-848-2399

Date: 3/5/2024

file:///#/EditInvoice/201003377
file:///#/EditInvoice/201033619
file:///#/EditInvoice/253774676


PO BOX 735457
DALLAS, TX 75373
P: 253-848-7186
F: 253-848-2399

Invoice 66231699
Invoice Date 9/27/2023

Completed Date 9/27/2023
Customer PO

Payment Term Due Upon Receipt
Due Date 9/27/2023

Billing Address
City of Roy #321-80
565 McNaught Road South
Roy, WA 98580 USA

Job Address
City Of Roy 
216 McNaught Road South
Roy, WA 98580 USA

Description of Work

Inspected septic system.1st chamber had 1” of scum on top and 12” of sludge on bottom.2nd chamber had 3” of scum on bottom. No
filter in outlet baffle. Pump chamber had 0” of scum and 0” of sludge.Pump and components working as intended.Got 4” of draw down
in 2 minutes.No ponding of the drain field.Lids secured when done.Report filed in RME.

Task # Description Quantity Your Price Your Total
OMF-PC-
23INSP

PIERCE COUNTY 2023 INSPECTION FEE 1.00 $64.50 $64.50

DES-PPIER Plumber Hourly Charge: (*07612-P) (Pierce County) 1.00 $150.00 $150.00

Sub-Total $214.50
Tax $17.59

Total Due $232.09
 

Balance Due $232.09
Please pay from this invoice. Terms: due 30 days from invoice date. Delinquency Charge 1% per month.

FloHawks is hereby authorized to furnish all materials and labor required to complete the requested work/service at 216 McNaught Road South,
Roy, WA 98580 USA 
and described herein. The estimated cost to perform this work is $437.94 at the time of inspection and with the information available at the time
of the inspection. If cost changes, the customer will be made aware prior to invoicing. If you Have any questions about this job, please ask your
service Expert TRACEY GIACOMELLI, he or she will be happy to help!

• Sheetrock/Drywall repair, painting and aesthetic restoration to be performed by others.

• In the event that utility lines are in the way, we may need to remove dirt by hydro excavation. 

• Any changes or extras not listed in bid may cost additional in labor and material. Customer will be notified and approve additional charges
before work is performed.

• Customer is responsible for removal or protection of personal items in and around work area before project begins.

• Cost of permit/inspection is not included in bid.

• Customer is responsible for access and coordination of plumbing inspector on scheduled date if applicable.

• All job related debris other than demolished concrete/asphalt or soil dirt to be disposed off site by us.

• If project is delayed/extended due to customer supplied fixtures or plans not ready on site, there will be additional trip charge.

• Coupons/promotions cannot be combined. If multiple discounts are available, we will apply the one offering the greater discount. 

• We are not responsible for existing condition of plumbing when we attempt to clear clog with a cable or hydro jetter.

• Due to the weight of our equipment, FloHawks can not be responsible for damage to driveways, landscape, walkways, paths etc. as a result of
our service, we make every attempt to prevent damage, but some driving surfaces are not rated to withstand the weight of service equipment.
in the case of any damage to driving surfaces, the customer accepts all liability for any damages. 

9/27/2023
Acknowledgement of Work/Service to be performed.
I, on behalf of City Of Roy hereby acknowledge that the work at 216 McNaught Road South, Roy, WA 98580 USA has been completed as agreed
upon. I have inspected the work and it is complete to my satisfaction.



9/27/2023



PO BOX 735457
DALLAS, TX 75373
P: 253-848-7186
F: 253-848-2399

Invoice 66231698
Invoice Date 9/27/2023

Completed Date 9/27/2023
Customer PO

Payment Term Due Upon Receipt
Due Date 9/27/2023

Billing Address
City of Roy #321-80
565 McNaught Road South
Roy, WA 98580 USA

Job Address
City of Roy
122 3rd Street
Roy, WA 98580 USA

Description of Work

Inspected septic system. All baffles are intact. I pulled filter and cleaned it.1st chamber had 2” of scum on top and 6” of sludge on
bottom.2nd chamber had 0/2”.Pump chamber had 0/0.Performed a draw down test and measured 3” of draw down in 2 minutes.Pump
components are working.No ponding of drain field.Lids secured when done.Was told to not pump due to levels found in tank.

Task # Description Quantity Your Price Your Total
DES-PPIER Plumber Hourly Charge: (*07612-P) (Pierce County) 2.00 $150.00 $300.00
OMF-PC-
23INSP

PIERCE COUNTY 2023 INSPECTION FEE 1.00 $64.50 $64.50

Sub-Total $364.50
Tax $29.89

Total Due $394.39
 

Balance Due $394.39
Please pay from this invoice. Terms: due 30 days from invoice date. Delinquency Charge 1% per month.

FloHawks is hereby authorized to furnish all materials and labor required to complete the requested work/service at 122 3rd Street, Roy, WA
98580 USA 
and described herein. The estimated cost to perform this work is $368.15 at the time of inspection and with the information available at the time
of the inspection. If cost changes, the customer will be made aware prior to invoicing. If you Have any questions about this job, please ask your
service Expert TRACEY GIACOMELLI, he or she will be happy to help!

• Sheetrock/Drywall repair, painting and aesthetic restoration to be performed by others.

• In the event that utility lines are in the way, we may need to remove dirt by hydro excavation. 

• Any changes or extras not listed in bid may cost additional in labor and material. Customer will be notified and approve additional charges
before work is performed.

• Customer is responsible for removal or protection of personal items in and around work area before project begins.

• Cost of permit/inspection is not included in bid.

• Customer is responsible for access and coordination of plumbing inspector on scheduled date if applicable.

• All job related debris other than demolished concrete/asphalt or soil dirt to be disposed off site by us.

• If project is delayed/extended due to customer supplied fixtures or plans not ready on site, there will be additional trip charge.

• Coupons/promotions cannot be combined. If multiple discounts are available, we will apply the one offering the greater discount. 

• We are not responsible for existing condition of plumbing when we attempt to clear clog with a cable or hydro jetter.

• Due to the weight of our equipment, FloHawks can not be responsible for damage to driveways, landscape, walkways, paths etc. as a result of
our service, we make every attempt to prevent damage, but some driving surfaces are not rated to withstand the weight of service equipment.
in the case of any damage to driving surfaces, the customer accepts all liability for any damages. 

9/27/2023
Acknowledgement of Work/Service to be performed.
I, on behalf of City of Roy hereby acknowledge that the work at 122 3rd Street, Roy, WA 98580 USA has been completed as agreed upon. I have
inspected the work and it is complete to my satisfaction.



9/27/2023



PO BOX 735457
DALLAS, TX 75373-5457

Invoice FINCHARGE
Invoice Date 1/31/2024

Payment Term Due Upon Receipt
Due Date 3/1/2024

Billing Address
City of Roy #321-80
565 McNaught Road South
Roy, WA 98580 USA

Description of Work

Task # Description Quantity Your Price Your Total
FC January 2024 Finance Charge 1.00 $6.26 $6.26

Sub-Total $6.26
Tax $0.00

Total Due $6.26
 

Balance Due $6.26
Please make arrangements to pay outstanding invoices.





Orca Pacific, Inc.
Orca Pacific Inc
280 44th St NW
Auburn WA 98001
United States

Invoice
#INV0608070
Invoice Date:2/29/2024
 

 

 

Order Memo:

INV0608070

1 of 1

Bill To Ship To

Roy, City of
PO Box 700
Roy WA 98580
United States

Roy, City of
215 Cedar Street W
Roy, WA 98580
Roy WA 98580
United States

Terms Due Date PO # Sales Rep Shipping Method Partner
Net 30 3/30/2024 Renee Lukins Orca Delivery

Qty Item Options Rate Amount

28 101-07841
HASA Multichlor Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% 10# 1 
Gallon

$11.67 $326.76

1 DLVRFULCHRG03
DELIVERY FUEL CHARGE 03

$36.00 $36.00

Amounts not paid when due will accrue interest at a rate of 1.5% per month Subtotal $362.76

  Tax Total (8.2%) $29.75

  Total $392.51

  Amount Paid $0.00

  Amount Due $392.51

https://go.solupay.com/myportal/invoice?ver=2&invoiceId=222856&tranId=INV0608070&companyId=6918666&total=$392.51&token=jwt012520004654529eyJhbGciOiJIUzI1NiIsInR5cCI6IkpXVCJ9..my2echhEJBalgQwI-f6IKSQF33gxV2-_5sOjeo_d8F0
https://go.solupay.com/myportal/invoice?ver=2&invoiceId=222856&tranId=INV0608070&companyId=6918666&total=$392.51&token=jwt012520004654529eyJhbGciOiJIUzI1NiIsInR5cCI6IkpXVCJ9..my2echhEJBalgQwI-f6IKSQF33gxV2-_5sOjeo_d8F0


Roy Court Collections

Vendor ID:  1056 2/29/2024

Municipal Court 9,045.25                                                 

Court Remitt Summary (Last 3 pgs)
Current Expense 3,520.33                                                 
Court Curr Exp 19.43                                                      
Crime Victims 56.41                                                      Remittance is sent to P   
Dist Driv Prev Remittance is sent to W   
MC Safety Account 
ST Gen Fund 40 1,843.26                                                 
St Gen Fund 50 1,166.50                                                 
St Gen Fund 54 2.55                                                        
Hwy Safety Act
Lab-blood Breathe
Death Inv Acct
JIS Account 914.27                                                    
Trauma Care 194.76                                                    
Auto Theft Prev (93) 389.41                                                    
Traum Brain Inj 192.78                                                    
WSP hiway Acct
DOL Tech Support 223.17                                                    
School Zone Safety 522.38                                                    

Timberland 9,045.25                  
357.37.00.0.001 Municipal Court Receipts (3,539.76)                
386.89.40.3.632 MC Safety Account -                           
386.83.40.1.632 Truma Care (194.76)                   
386.83.40.0.632 Auto Theft Prevention (ST GF 93) (389.41)                   
386.83.40.2.632 Traumatic Brain Injury (192.78)                   
386.83.40.3.632 Distracted Driver Prevention -                           
386.85.01.0.632 Hwy Safety Act -                           
386.88.40.0.632 State PSEA (2.55)                        
386.89.40.0.632 WSP Hiway Act -                           
386.89.40.1.632 Death Invest Toxocology Lab -                           
386.92.40.0.632 PSEA - 2 Public Safety Education (1,166.50)                
386.91.40.0.632 PSEA - 1 Public Safety Education (1,843.26)                
386.12.40.0.632 Crime Victims/Local Infranction (56.41)                      
386.96.40.0.632 Lab/Blood/Breath State Remit -                           
386.97.40.0.632 Judicial Info Sys (914.27)                   
386.89.40.4.632 DOL Tech Suppor (223.17)                   
386.99.40.0.632 School Zone Safety (522.38)                   

-                           





 

 

Bill To Invoice Number Date 

City of Roy 
Attn: Accounts Payable 
PO Box 700 
Roy WA 98580  

23-074 1/20/2023 

  

Account No. Due Date* 
ROYC002 2/21/2023 

 

CALENDAR YEAR 2023 CLEAN AIR ASSESSMENT 
(Supplemental Share of Support as defined by the Washington State Clean Air Act {RCW 70.94.093}) 

 

City of 2023 ASSESSMENT 

Roy $   516 
 

Your Clean Air Assessment Last Year Was $   482 
 

 

Quarter Due Date Amount 
Quarter 1 2/21/2023 $   129.00 

Quarter 2 5/01/2023 $   129.00 

Quarter 3 7/31/2023 $   129.00 

Quarter 4 10/31/2023 $   129.00 
 

*Payments may be made in quarterly installments. If paying quarterly, please refer to the schedule above.



















































FORM A8-2 Rev 07/23a STATE OF WASHINGTON CASH RECEIPTS JOURNAL SUMMARY
Cnty 827
AGENCY NO. FOR PERIOD OF DATE OF DEPOSIT

(CITY)
8500 2000 OST

Cash Mgt
FUND SOURCE SUB TOTAL DEPOSITED Use Only
001 0299
001 0405 000013 1,843.26
001 0405 000023 1,166.50
001 0405 000033 2.55 001 Total:
001 0405 000055 389.41
001 0597 132021 3,401.72
02K 0421 02K Total: 
02K 0299 0.00 0.00
02G 0405
03C 0420 194.76
04V 0405 000095
07V 0405 07V001
07W 0299 185200
081 0299 0.00
082 0405 000025 MOTOR CYCLE SAFETY EDUCATION ACCOUNT (RCW 46.20.500(1)) 0.00
084 0299 000001
106 0405 030000 0.00
108 0299 MOTOR VEHICLE ACCOUNT (RCW 46.61.165(4)(d))

12T 0405 050000 192.78
16A 0425 000003
16E 0405 000043
16L 0405 000053
17W 0405 000020
18K 0405 000222
19P 0405 000040
146 0236 146 Total:
146 0405 0.00
218 0405 000063
21M 0299 000053
23G 0405 000085 VULNERABLE ROADWAY USER ED ACCOUNT(RCW 48.61.145)

23K 0405 SMOKE DETECTION AWARENESS ACCOUNT (RCW 43.44.110(4))

23T 0299 CONGESTION RELIEF TRAFFIC SAFETY ACCOUNT (RCW 46.61.165(4)(d))

237 0405
24A 0405 000001
24Q 0405 000087 COOPER JONES ACTIVE TRANSPORTATION ACCT. (RCW 46.63.170(6)(e))

25W 0254 000053 DRIVER LIC TECH SUP ACCT.(RCW 46.63.110(8)(b), RCW 2.68.040(7)) 223.17
515 0299
543 0299 000043 914.27
777 0299
780 0405 000083 522.38

PHONE NUMBER OST DOC NUMBER TOTALPREPARED BY

85002000 5,449.08

ST GEN FUND 50 (PSEA 2)

ST GEN FUND 40 (PSEA 1)

CRIME LABORATORY ANALYSIS FEE (RCW 43.43.690)

ACCOUNT DISTRIBUTION

DOMESTIC VIOLENCE PREVENTION ACCT (RCW 26.50.110)

RECREATION ACCESS PASS ACCOUNT (RCW 7.84.100)

E-MAIL ADDRESS

FUND AND REVENUE ACCOUNT TITLE

BUILDING CODE COUNCIL ACCOUNT (FEE - RCW 19.27.085)

STATE PATROL HIGHWAY ACCOUNT (RCW 46.61.5054)

VEHICLE LICENSE FRAUD ACCOUNT (RCW 46.16A.030)

EMERGENCY MED SERVICES AND TRAUMA CARE (RCW 46.63.110)

SCHOOL ZONE SAFETY ACCOUNT (RCW 46.61.440)

PROSTITUTION PREVENTION AND INTERVENTION (RCW 43.63A.740)

JUDICIAL INFORMATION SYSTEMS ACCOUNT (RCW 2.68.040)

DNA DATABASE ACCOUNT (RCW 43.43.7541)

CITY/TOWN NAME

Roy Feb-24

DEATH INVESTIGATIONS ACCOUNT (Toxicology Lab - RCW 46.61.5054)

DEATH INVESTIGATIONS ACCOUNT (Certified Copies - RCW 70.58.107)

HIGHWAY SAFETY ACCOUNT (RCW 46.61.5054)

HEALTH PROFESSIONS ACCOUNT (RCW 18.130.190)

DRUG FORFEITED PROPERTY (RCW 69.50.505)

ST GEN FUND 54 (PSEA 3)

CHILD RESCUE ACCOUNT (C 279 L 15)

VITAL RECORDS (Certified Copies - RCW 70.58.107)

24/7 SOBRIETY ACCOUNT (RCW 36.28A.370)

DISTRACTED DRIVING PREVENTION ACCOUNT (C 334 L 17)

FISH AND WILDLIFE ENFORCEMENT REWARD (RCW 77.15.420)

ST GEN FUND 93  (WA AUTO THEFT)

SPECIALIZED FOREST PRODUCTS OUTREACH & ED (RCW 76.48)

JUDICIAL STABILIZATION TRUST ACCOUNT (RCW 43.79.505)

TRAUMATIC BRAIN INJURY ACCOUNT (RCW 46.63.110)

MULTIMODAL TRANSPORTATION ACCOUNT (RCW 47.66.070)

FIREARMS RANGE ACCOUNT (PROCEEDS - RCW 9.41.098)

FIREARMS RANGE ACCOUNT (FEES - RCW 9.41.098)

LIMOUSINE CARRIERS ACCOUNT (RCW 46.72A.160)

ACCESSIBLE COMMUNITIES ACCOUNT (50.40.071)
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